
 

BID DATE: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 

BID FOR: Asphalt Materials  

BID NUMBER: 202003-445 

RESPONSES RECEIVED FROM: Vance Brothers Asphalt & Fuel 

Supply 

Coastal 

Energy Corp. 

Leo Journagan APAC - Central 

Item 

# 

Description Quantity 

(Est.) 

Unit Unit Price (BID) Unit Price 

(BID) 

Unit Price 

(BID) 

Unit Price 

(BID) 

Unit Price 

(BID) 

 FURNISHED & 

DELIVERED 

       

3.2.1 MC-30 10,000 Gallon $2.95 $2.05 $2.24 No Bid $2.17 

3.2.2 MC-800 500 Gallon $2.90 $1.95 $2.09 No Bid $2.00 

3.2.3 

MC-3000 (must be 

280° upon 

delivery, at 

vendors expense) 200,000 Gallon 

$2.85 $1.96 $1.89 No Bid $1.94 

 

EMULSIFIED - 

FURNISHED & 

DELIVERED   

     

3.3.1 CSS-1H 25,000 Gallon $2.15 No Bid $1.97 No Bid No Bid 

3.3.2 CRS-2P 50,000 Gallon $2.40 No Bid $1.99 No Bid No Bid 

3.3.3 CRS-2 50,000 Gallon $2.15 No Bid $1.79 No Bid No Bid 

3.3.4 

CQS-1F (Rapid Set 

Fogseal) 25,000 Gallon 

$2.25 No Bid $1.74 No Bid No Bid 

 

BID AWARD TABULATION FORM 
 



  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Tuesday, April 14, 2020: After opening responses from the above listed companies, initial details were noted and documented by Road & Bridge Administrator, Devin 
Huff. All packages will be thoroughly reviewed in preparation of the formal award recommendation. 
 
Thursday, April 16, 2020: An agenda request has been made, and approved, to deliver a formal recommendation for award to the Taney County Commission on 
Monday, April 20, 2020. 
 
Monday, April 20, 2020: After a thorough review by Mr. Huff, a determination was made that responses received were fully qualified and compliant with all bid 
requirements and specifications as asked for. It is formally recommended that Coastal Energy Corporation is awarded as the Primary supplier, and Vance Brothers is 
awarded as the Secondary supplier, for this bid. 
 
The Taney County Commission reviewed the information, made a motion as such and it passed unanimously. 
 
 
 
 

Nikki Lawrence 
Director of Purchasing 

Taney County, Missouri 
April 20, 2020 

 

FURNISHED 

AND LAID IN 

PLACE   

     

3.4.1 Black Base, Hot Mix 10,000 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid $72.50 No Bid 

3.4.2 

Hot Mix Surface 

Material 15,000 Ton 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.50 No Bid 

 

FURNISHED & 

LOADED ON 

COUNTY 

TRUCKS AT 

BIDDER’S 

PLANT   

     

3.5.1 Black Base, Hot Mix 1,000 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid 

3.5.2 

Hot Mix Surface 

Material 15,000 Ton 

No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid 

3.5.3 Cold Mix Patch 2,500 Ton $77.50 No Bid No Bid  No Bid 

 DELIVERED        

3.6.1 Cold Patch Mix 3,500 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid 


