



BID AWARD INFORMATION

BID DATE; Wednesday April 20, 2016

BID FOR; Aggregate Rock

BID NUMBER; **RFB# 201603-334**

Wednesday April 20, 2016: After opening four (4) responses received for the above listed RFB, in the Commission Hearing Room – in public, a decision was made to allow a time for a thorough review of said information by Road & Bridge Interim Administrator Randy Haes. Thereafter an agenda request was made, and approved, to deliver a recommendation for award on Monday April 25, 2016.

Monday April 25, 2016: Subsequent to a thorough review of the detailed pricing offered, within each Bid Package Response received, Mr. Haes recommended a multiple award process as detailed on the attachment to the Taney County Commission. The Commission asked Mr. Haes to re-examine the responses to make sure his recommendation would offer the best solutions specific to price as well as address previous supply shortage and delivery issues. A motion to table the award for now was made and it passed unanimously.

Wednesday April 27, 2016: Mr. Haes completed his additional review and submitted an agenda request which was approved to deliver a final recommendation for award on Monday May 2, 2016.

Monday May 2, 2016: Given the complex nature of this RFB, and the extensive details within each response, as we had asked for within the bid, Road & Bridge Office Manager Kathy Roberts prepared a spreadsheet to compare the required information. This expertly created tool was used by the Commission and is also attached here. After a lengthy discussion concerning all of the details of this final recommendation, including the spreadsheet as mentioned above, the Taney County Commission made a motion to award primary to Table Rock Asphalt, secondary to Buchanan Materials and tertiary to APAC. This motion is based on a complete and thorough evaluation of the lowest & best bid response, acting in the best interest of the county. Subsequent vote passed unanimously to award as such.

Thank you.

Ron Erickson,
Director of Purchasing
Taney County Missouri
May 2, 2016

APAC Mizumi, Inc. c/o David Branson 4900 W. Calhoun P.O. Box 1187 Springfield, MD 20682 417-868-6700 Fax: 417-868-6788 dbranson@pacmizumi.com	American Rock & Concrete c/o Mike Swearingen 1150 Buchanan Road Branson, MO 65616 417-337-7625 Fax: 417-334-1693 mizumi2002@yahoo.com	American Rock & Concrete c/o Mike Swearingen 1150 Buchanan Road Branson, MO 65616 417-337-7625 Fax: 417-334-1693 mizumi2002@yahoo.com	American Rock & Concrete c/o Mike Swearingen 1150 Buchanan Road Branson, MO 65616 417-337-7625 Fax: 417-334-1693 mizumi2002@yahoo.com	Blount Asphalt Const. Co. Inc. c/o Teresa C. Bowers P.O. Box 230 Mt. Vernon, MO 65651 417-468-7978 Fax: 417-468-7914 tcbowers@blountasphalt.com	Clear Stone Co., Inc. c/o Michael J. Donovan 1075 View Hill Road Clayton, MO 65631 417-343-2084 Fax: 417-343-2085 mjd@clearstoneco.com	Coastal Energy Corp. c/o Chad Cole P.O. Box 218 Wilson Springs, MO 417-869-2777 Fax: 417-869-2965 chad@cecorp.com	Concrete Company of the Ozarks c/o John Halverson P.O. Box 1665 Branson, MO 65616 417-363-2000 Fax: 417-363-2065 john@concreteco.com	Leo Journeaux Construction Co., Inc. c/o Dale Pomeroy 3003 E. Chateau Expy, Suite 1200 Springfield, MO 65802 417-869-7222 Fax: 417-869-7421 dlep@ljcc.com	Leo Journeaux Construction Co., Inc. c/o Dale Pomeroy 3003 E. Chateau Expy, Suite 1200 Springfield, MO 65802 417-869-7222 Fax: 417-869-7421 dlep@ljcc.com	Leo Journeaux Construction Co., Inc. c/o Dale Pomeroy 3003 E. Chateau Expy, Suite 1200 Springfield, MO 65802 417-869-7222 Fax: 417-869-7421 dlep@ljcc.com	Stallop & Sons c/o John Stallop P.O. Box 783 Fowler, MO 65663 417-546-0866 jstallop@stallop.com	Stallop & Sons c/o John Stallop P.O. Box 783 Fowler, MO 65663 417-546-0866 jstallop@stallop.com	Tabernack Asphalt Construction c/o Jim David P.O. Box 1165 Branson, MO 65616 417-334-2144 Fax: 417-334-2157 jim@tabernack.com	Tabernack Asphalt Construction c/o Jim David P.O. Box 1165 Branson, MO 65616 417-334-2144 Fax: 417-334-2157 jim@tabernack.com	Tabernack Asphalt Construction c/o Jim David P.O. Box 1165 Branson, MO 65616 417-334-2144 Fax: 417-334-2157 jim@tabernack.com	YoungKerans Construction c/o Brad Young 14475 Lamerica 1200 Maconville, MO 65705 417-719-8555 youngkeransconstruction@gmail.com	YoungKerans Construction c/o Brad Young 14475 Lamerica 1200 Maconville, MO 65705 417-719-8555 youngkeransconstruction@gmail.com
---	---	---	---	---	--	---	--	---	---	---	--	--	---	---	---	--	--

2.0 AGGREGATE ROCK:			DELIVERED BUCHANAN		DELIVERED HILDA		DELIVERED MT. BRANSON		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)	
Item Number	Quantity (Estimate for 2014)	Unit	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP	DELIVERED	PICKED UP
1.2	10' Clean Chips	5,000	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.25	\$8.25	\$13.75	\$8.25	\$8.00	\$8.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.20	\$14.00	No Bid	\$14.00	No Bid	\$14.00	No Bid	No Bid	12.85	9.95	17.35	9.95	12.15	9.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
1.3	3/4" Clean Chips	25,000	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.25	\$7.50	\$13.00	\$7.50	\$8.10	\$7.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.20	\$14.00	No Bid	\$14.00	No Bid	\$14.00	No Bid	No Bid	12.85	9.95	17.35	9.95	12.15	9.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
1.4	3/4" Clean Chips (Concrete Rock)	600	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.25	\$7.25	\$12.75	\$7.25	\$8.00	\$7.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.20	\$12.00	No Bid	\$12.00	No Bid	\$12.00	No Bid	No Bid	12.85	9.95	17.35	9.95	12.15	9.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
1.3	1" Base Material	25,000	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.00	\$4.00	\$9.60	\$4.00	\$6.10	\$4.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.70	\$5.50	\$7.80	\$5.50	No Bid	\$5.50	\$5.50	No Bid	No Bid	7.45	4.50	11.90	4.50	8.70	4.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1.5	2" Base Material	1,000	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.30	\$4.30	\$9.80	\$4.30	\$6.40	\$4.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.70	\$5.50	\$8.10	\$5.50	No Bid	\$5.50	\$5.50	No Bid	No Bid	7.85	4.75	12.15	4.75	8.95	4.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1.6	0.4" Sub-Base Material	25,000	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.30	\$4.30	\$9.80	\$4.30	\$6.40	\$4.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.85	\$5.65	\$8.55	\$5.65	No Bid	\$5.65	\$5.65	No Bid	No Bid	7.80	5.00	12.40	5.00	7.20	5.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1.7	2.4" Sub-Base Material	1,000	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.25	\$5.25	\$10.75	\$5.25	\$7.25	\$5.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.80	\$6.60	\$9.60	\$6.60	No Bid	\$6.60	\$6.60	No Bid	No Bid	8.90	6.00	13.40	6.00	8.20	6.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1.8	Pugged Base Rock	2,000	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.00	\$5.00	\$10.50	\$5.00	\$7.40	\$5.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.00	\$5.80	\$8.60	\$5.80	No Bid	\$5.80	\$5.80	No Bid	No Bid	7.20	6.00	12.40	6.00	7.20	6.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1.9	1 1/4" Grt (In Control Material)	5,000	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.00	\$8.00	\$9.50	\$8.00	\$8.10	\$8.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.70	\$9.50	No Bid	\$9.50	No Bid	\$9.50	\$9.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.50	14.50	13.00	\$9.50	14.50	13.00	\$9.50	14.50	13.00	No Bid	No Bid
1.10	Rip Rap	5,000	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.25	\$8.25	\$14.75	\$8.25	\$12.40	\$8.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.50	\$16.00	\$16.50	\$16.00	No Bid	\$16.00	\$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	16.10	13.00	20.80	13.00	15.40	13.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1.11	Shot Rock (up to 12" size rock)	10,000	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.00	\$8.00	\$9.50	\$8.00	\$8.50	\$8.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.00	\$8.50	\$7.20	\$8.50	No Bid	\$8.50	\$8.50	No Bid	No Bid	8.10	5.00	12.80	5.00	7.40	5.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

2.0 ASPHALT MATERIALS, FURNISHED AND DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN TANEY COUNTY:			UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)	
2.1	MC 30	500	Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
2.2	MC 800	5,000	Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
2.3	MC 3000	200,000	Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.86	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

3.0 EMULSIFIED ASPHALT MATERIALS FURNISHED AND DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN TANEY COUNTY:			UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)	
3.1	EA-300	10,000	Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.38	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
3.2	SS-1	20,000	Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.08	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
3.3	CRS-2P	50,000	Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
3.4	CRS-2	50,000	Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
3.5	CGS-1P (Rapid Set Emulsa)	25,000	Gallon	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

4.0 BITUMINOUS MIX BIDS, FURNISHED AND LAID IN PLACE AT VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN TANEY COUNTY, AS PER PREVALING WAGE:			UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)	
4.1	Black Base, Hot Mix	10,000	Ton	\$55.25	**Plus haul rate	No Bid	No Bid	\$44.05	**Plus haul rate	No Bid	No Bid	\$48.97	**Plus haul rate	\$48.97	**Plus haul rate	\$45.97	**Plus haul rate	No Bid	No Bid	\$61.50	**Plus haul rate	\$61.50	**Plus haul rate	\$61.80	**Plus haul rate	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
4.2	Hot Mix Surface Material	15,000	Ton	\$57.70	**Plus haul rate	No Bid	No Bid	\$48.25	**Plus haul rate	No Bid	No Bid	\$53.57	**Plus haul rate	\$53.57	**Plus haul rate	\$53.57	**Plus haul rate	No Bid	No Bid	\$68.80	**Plus haul rate	\$68.80	**Plus haul rate	\$68.80	**Plus haul rate	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

5.0 BITUMINOUS MIX BIDS, FURNISHED AND LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT BIDDERS PLANT:			UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)	
5.1	Black Base, Hot Mix	1,000	Ton	\$51.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$60.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$54.00	\$54.00	\$54.00	\$54.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
5.2	Hot Mix Surface Material	15,000	Ton	\$53.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$62.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$55.00	\$55.00	\$55.00	\$55.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$62.00	\$62.00	\$62.00	\$62.00	\$62.00	\$62.00	\$62.00	\$62.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		
5.3	Cold Mix Patch	2,000	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$55.00	\$52.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$54.00	\$54.00	\$54.00	\$54.00	\$54.00	\$54.00	\$48.25	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	\$53.00	

6.0 BITUMINOUS MIX BIDS, DELIVERED TO ALL COUNTY FACILITIES:			UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)	
6.1	Cold Mix Patch	3,000	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$62.77	**Plus haul rate	\$56.00 Buchanan \$58.30 Mt. Branson \$59.00 Hilda	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$67.00	\$61.50	\$66.30	\$61.80	\$66.80	\$62.30	\$64.80 Per Ton Delivered Hilda	\$64.80 Per Ton Delivered Hilda	\$64.80 Per Ton Delivered Hilda	\$64.80 Per Ton Delivered Hilda	\$64.80 Per Ton Delivered Hilda	\$64.80 Per Ton Delivered Hilda	\$64.80 Per Ton Delivered Hilda	\$64.80 Per Ton Delivered Hilda	\$64.80 Per Ton Delivered Hilda	

7.0 CONCRETE FURNISHED AND DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN TANEY COUNTY:			UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)	
7.1	Concrete Class B	300	Cubic Yards	No Bid	\$98.00	\$98.00	\$98.00	\$98.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$108.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	\$102.00		
7.2	Standard 6-Bag Mix	300	Cubic Yards	No Bid	\$87.00	\$87.00	\$87.00	\$87.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$97.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00	\$90.00		
7.3	Flowable F8	300	Cubic Yards	No Bid	\$84.00	\$84.00	\$84.00	\$84.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$93.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$85.80	No Bid	No Bid	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$85.80	\$85.80		

8.0 FINISHED DIRT LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT PIT OT QUARRY:			UNIT PRICE (BID)		UNIT PRICE (BID)	
---	--	--	------------------	--	------------------	--

BID TAB FORM 201603-334
Aggregate Rock

APAC-Central
c/o Kirt Younger
P.O. Box 9208
Fayetteville, Arkansas 72703
870-416-6310
Fax-479-521-2826
kirt.younger@apac.com

APAC-Central
c/o Kirt Younger
755 E. Millsap Rd., P.O. Box 9208
Fayetteville, Arkansas 72703
479-587-3301
Fax-479-521-2826
kirt.younger@apac.com

APAC-Central
c/o Kirt Younger
755 E. Millsap Rd., P.O. Box 9208
Fayetteville, Arkansas 72703
479-587-3301
Fax-479-521-2826
kirt.younger@apac.com

Buchanan Materials
c/o Steven Redford Jr.
4675 N. Gretna Rd Ste # 201
Branson, Missouri 65616
417-294-0074
Fax-417-334-3636
redfords09@gmail.com

Buchanan Materials
c/o Steven Redford Jr.
4675 N. Gretna Rd Ste #201
Branson, Missouri 65616
417-294-0074
Fax-417-334-3636
redfords09@gmail.com

Buchanan Materials
c/o Steven Redford Jr.
4675 N. Gretna Rd Ste #201
Branson, Missouri 65616
417-294-0074
Fax-417-334-3636
redfords09@gmail.com

6.0 AGGREGATE ROCK:			<u>Delivered response time/delivery: 1 day notice</u>		<u>Delivered response time/delivery: 1 day notice</u>		<u>Delivered response time/delivery: 1 day notice</u>		<u>Delivered response time/delivery:</u>		<u>Delivered response time/delivery:</u>		<u>Delivered response time/delivery:</u>	
Item Number	Quantity (Estimate for 2016/2017)	Unit	BUCHANAN UNIT PRICE (BID)		HILDA UNIT PRICE (BID)	MT. BRANSON UNIT PRICE (BID)	BUCHANAN UNIT PRICE (BID)		HILDA UNIT PRICE (BID)	MT. BRANSON UNIT PRICE (BID)				
			PICKED UP AT QUARRY	DELIVERED	DELIVERED	DELIVERED	PICKED UP AT QUARRY	DELIVERED	DELIVERED	DELIVERED				
6.1	1/2" Clean Chips	5,000	Ton	\$8.50	\$11.40	\$16.25	\$12.00	\$8.55	\$10.58	\$15.40	\$11.24			
6.2	3/8" Clean Chips	25,000	Ton	\$9.00	\$11.90	\$16.75	\$12.50	\$8.55	\$10.58	\$15.40	\$11.24			
6.3	3/4" Clean Chips (Concrete Rock)	500	Ton	\$7.25	\$10.15	\$15.00	\$10.75	\$8.55	\$10.58	\$15.40	\$11.24			
6.4	1" Base Material	25,000	Ton	\$4.25	\$7.15	\$12.00	\$7.75	\$4.50	\$6.53	\$11.35	\$7.19			
6.5	2" Base Material	1,000	Ton	\$4.25	\$7.15	\$12.00	\$7.75	\$4.50	\$6.53	\$11.35	\$7.19			
6.6	0-6" Sub-Base Material	25,000	Ton	\$4.25	\$7.15	\$12.00	\$7.75	\$4.50	\$6.53	\$11.35	\$7.19			
6.7	2-6" Sub-Base Material	1,000	Ton	\$5.25	\$8.15	\$13.00	\$8.75	\$5.40	\$7.43	\$12.25	\$8.09			
6.8	Pugged Base Rock	2,000	Ton	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	\$4.95	\$6.98	\$11.80	\$7.64			
6.9	1/4" Grit (Ice Control Material)	5,000	Ton	\$4.25	\$7.15	\$12.00	\$7.75	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"			
6.10	Rip Rap	5,000	Ton	\$9.00	\$11.90	\$16.75	\$12.50	\$11.70	\$13.93		\$14.59			
6.11	Shot Rock (up to 12" size rock)	10,000	Ton	\$4.00	\$6.90	\$11.75	\$7.50	\$4.05	\$6.28	\$11.10	\$6.94			

Leo Journagan Construction Co., Inc.
c/o Flint Wendland
3003 E. Chestnut Expressway
Springfield, Missouri 65802
417-869-7222
Fax-417-869-7421
f.wendland@journagan.com

Leo Journagan Construction Co., Inc.
c/o Flint Wendland
3003 E. Chestnut Expressway
Springfield, Missouri 65802
417-869-7222
Fax-417-869-7421
f.wendland@journagan.com

Leo Journagan Construction Co., Inc.
c/o Flint Wendland
3003 E. Chestnut Expressway
Springfield, Missouri 65802
417-869-7222
Fax-417-869-7421
f.wendland@journagan.com

TRAC Materials, Inc.
c/o Joel Simmons
310 N. Commercial
Branson, Missouri 65616
417-334-2144
Fax-417-334-2157
joel@tablerockasphalt.com

TRAC Materials, Inc.
c/o Joel Simmons
310 N. Commercial
Branson, Missouri 65616
417-334-2144
Fax-417-334-2157
joel@tablerockasphalt.com

TRAC Materials, Inc.
c/o Joel Simmons
310 N. Commercial
Branson, Missouri 65616
417-334-2144
Fax-417-334-2157
joel@tablerockasphalt.com

6.0 AGGREGATE ROCK:			<u>Delivered response time/delivery: 24 Hours</u>		<u>Delivered response time/delivery: 24 Hours</u>		<u>Delivered response time/delivery: 24 Hours</u>		<u>Delivered response time/delivery: 24 Hours</u>		<u>Delivered response time/delivery: 24 Hours</u>		<u>Delivered response time/delivery: 24 Hours</u>	
Item Number	Quantity (Estimate for 2016/2017)	Unit	BUCHANAN UNIT PRICE (BID)		HILDA UNIT PRICE (BID)	MT. BRANSON UNIT PRICE (BID)	BUCHANAN UNIT PRICE (BID)		HILDA UNIT PRICE (BID)	MT. BRANSON UNIT PRICE (BID)				
			PICKED UP AT QUARRY	DELIVERED	DELIVERED	DELIVERED	PICKED UP AT QUARRY	DELIVERED	DELIVERED	DELIVERED				
6.1	1/2" Clean Chips	5,000	Ton	\$10.00	\$14.83	\$18.97	\$13.36	\$9.50	\$11.53	\$16.35	\$12.19			
6.2	3/8" Clean Chips	25,000	Ton	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	\$9.50	\$11.53	\$16.35	\$12.19			
6.3	3/4" Clean Chips (Concrete Rock)	500	Ton	\$12.00	\$16.83	\$20.97	\$15.36	\$9.50	\$11.53	\$16.35	\$12.19			
6.4	1" Base Material	25,000	Ton	\$5.45	\$10.28	\$14.42	\$8.84	\$5.00	\$7.03	\$11.85	\$7.69			
6.5	2" Base Material	1,000	Ton	\$5.25	\$10.08	\$14.22	\$8.64	\$5.00	\$7.03	\$11.85	\$7.69			
6.6	0-6" Sub-Base Material	25,000	Ton	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	\$5.00	\$7.03	\$11.85	\$7.69			
6.7	2-6" Sub-Base Material	1,000	Ton	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	\$6.00	\$8.03	\$12.85	\$8.69			
6.8	Pugged Base Rock	2,000	Ton	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	\$5.50	\$7.53	\$12.35	\$8.19			
6.9	1/4" Grit (Ice Control Material)	5,000	Ton	\$10.00	\$14.83	\$18.97	\$13.36	1/4" Grit \$3.00 \$10.00	1/4" Grit \$5.03 \$12.03	1/4" Grit \$9.85 \$16.85	1/4" Grit \$5.69 \$12.69			
6.10	Rip Rap	5,000	Ton	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	\$15.00	\$17.24	\$22.05	\$17.23			
6.11	Shot Rock (up to 12" size rock)	10,000	Ton	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	"No Bid"	\$4.50	\$6.73	\$11.55	\$7.39			