
 

BID AWARD INFORMATION 

BID DATE;   Tuesday April 29, 2014 

BID FOR;   Asphalt & Materials 

BID NUMBER;    RFB# 201403-258 

 
 
Tuesday April 29, 2014:  After opening eight (8) responses received for the above listed RFB, in the 
Commission Conference Room – in public, a decision was made to allow a time for a thorough review of 
said information by Road & Bridge Coordinator Randy Haes. Thereafter an agenda request was made, 
and approved, to deliver a recommendation for award on Monday May 5, 2014.  
 
Monday May 5, 2014: Subsequent to a thorough review of the detailed pricing offered, within each Bid 
Package Response received, Mr. Haes recommended a multiple award process as detailed on the 
attachments to the Taney County Commission. A motion to award as such was made and it passed 
unanimously. 

Given the complex nature of this RFB, and the extensive details as asked for within each response, we 
asked the Road & Bridge Office Manager – Kathy Roberts to prepare a Bid Tabulation Spreadsheet 
which she did in amazing fashion. Please see it attached here. The Taney County Commission used her 
spreadsheet as a vital tool to review all responses and thereby concur with the recommendation. For the 
record they offered their appreciation directly to Kathy for her hard work resulting in an exemplary 
spreadsheet. 

 

Thank you. 

Ron Erickson, 
Director of Purchasing 

Taney County Missouri 
May 5, 2014 



 
                  County of   
                                                                              State of Missouri 

TANEY COUNTY COURTHOUSE 
P.O. BOX 1018   FORSYTH, MO 65653 

(417) 546-7268  FAX:  (417) 546-7710 
 

 
 
  
Randy Haes    Kathy Roberts   Angie Edwards 
Interim Road and Bridge Administrator    Office Manager   Clerk 
 
 
Date: March 5, 2014 
 
Re: Taney County Bid #201403-258 
 
To: Taney County Commission 
 
Dear Sirs, 
     I have reviewed the bids received from eight vendors and recommend that award group 1.0 
and 2.0 to Coastal Energy Corp. and secondary to Vance Brothers Inc. They were the only 
two bidders on these two groups.  
    Group 3.0, 4.0, 5.0, and 6.0 I would recommend awarding  to TRAC Materials as primary 
vendor. Secondary on group 3.0 and 4.0 award to Leo Journagan Construction Co.  
    Group 5.0 secondary award to Clever Stone Co. and group 6.0 award secondary to 
American Rock and Concrete. 
 
 
 
Randy Haes 
 
 
Interim Taney County Road & Bridge Administrator 
 
 
 
 
 



BID TAB FORM  201403-258
Asphalt & Materials 

1.0

Item # Delivered Unit

1.1 MC 30 500 Gallon

1.2 MC 800 5,000 Gallon

1.3 MC 3000 200,000 Gallon

2.0

Item # Delivered Unit

2.1 EA-300 10,000 Gallon

2.2 SS-1 20,000 Gallon

2.3 CRS-2P 50,000 Gallon

2.4 CRS-2 50,000 Gallon

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

EMULSIFIED ASPHALT MATERIALS FURNISHED AND DELIVERED TO VARIOUS 
LOCATION IN TANEY COUNTY:

Quantity 
(Estimate for 
2014/2015)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ASPHALT MATERIALS,FURNISHED AND DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS 
IN TANEY COUNTY:

Quantity 
(Estimate for 
2014/2015)

melissa_forshee2001@yahoo.com

American Rock & Concrete
c/o Melissa Johnson

1150 Buchanan Road
Branson, MO. 65616

417-337-7625
Fax-417-337-7628

Delivered response time/delivery: 24 Hours

No Bid

No Bid

mailto:melissa_forshee2001@yahoo.com


2.5 CQS-1FS (Rapid Set Fogseal) 25,000 Gallon

3.0

Item # Delivered Unit

3.1 Black Base, Hot Mix 10,000 Ton

3.2 Hot Mix Surface Material 15,000 Ton

4.0

Item # Delivered Unit

4.1 Black Base, Hot Mix 1,000 Ton

4.2 Hot Mix Surface Material 15,000 Ton

4.3 Cold Mix Patch 2,500 Ton

5.0

Item # Delivered Unit

5.1 Cold Mix Patch 3,500 Ton

BITMINOUS MIX BIDS, FURNISHED AND LAID IN PLACE AT VARIOUS 
LOCATIONS IN TANEY COUNTY, AS PER PREVALING WAGE:

Quantity 
(Estimate for 
2014/2015)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

BITMINOUS MIX BIDS, FURNISHED AND LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT 
BIDDERS PLANT:

Quantity 
(Estimate for 
2014/2015)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

BITMINOUS MIX BIDS, DELIVERED TO ALL COUNTY FACILITIES:

Quantity 
(Estimate for 
2014/2015)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



6.0

Item # Delivered Unit

6.1 Concrete Class B 300 Cubic Yards

6.2 Standard 6-Bag Mix 300 Cubic Yards

6.3 Flowable Fill 300 Cubic Yards

Orange Primary

Blue Seconday 

CONCRETE FURNISHED AND DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN TANEY 
COUNTY:

Quantity 
(Estimate for 
2014/2015)

$92.00

$94.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$74.00



No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$2.35

$2.15

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

Delivered response time/delivery: 24-48 Hours Delivered response time/delivery: 24 Hours

Pump charge $70.00, Demurrage $70 per hr after 2 hours

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

$2.98

$2.89

$2.32

$1.94

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.45

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

417-743-2694
Fax-417-743-2945

mdonelson@cleverstone.com

Clever Stone Co., Inc.
c/o David C. Donelson
1075 Wise Hill Road
Clever, MO. 65631

Coastal Energy Corp.
c/o Chad Odle
P.O. Box 218

Willow Springs, MO. 
417-469-2777

Fax-417-469-2294
chad@coastal-fmc.com

APAC-Central
c/o Douglas Fronick

P.O. Box 1187
Springfield,  Missouri 65801

417-868-6700
Fax-417-868-6785 

Douglas.Fronick@apac.com

No Bid

mailto:mdonelson@cleverstone.com
mailto:chad@coastal-fmc.com
mailto:Douglas.Fronick@apac.com


$50.00 **Plus haul rate

$57.00 **Plus haul rate

No Bid No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$2.18

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

$55.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$60.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

Asphalt plant is in Willard Mo 
(Approx 50 miles from Branson )

UNIT PRICE (BID)



UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid



Delivered response time/delivery: 24 Hours ARO

Tablerock Asphalt Construction
c/o Joel Simmons

P.O. Box 1165
Branson, MO. 65615

417-334-2144
Fax-417-334-2157

joel@tablerockasphalt.com

Vance Brothers. Inc.
c/o Robert A. Vance

5201 Brighton
Kansas City, Missouri  64130

816-923-4325
Fax-816-923-6472

rvance@vancebrothes.com

Delivered response time/delivery: 1 Week

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

Delivered response time/delivery: Laid in place--2 
weeks, cold mix---1 week

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.55

$3.40

$3.40

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$2.40

$2.35

$2.65

$2.35

dpopejoy@journagan.com

Leo Journagan Construction Co., Inc.
c/o Dale Popejoy

3003 E. Chestnut Expwy, Suite 1200
Springfield, MO. 65802

417-869-7222
Fax-417-869-7421

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

mailto:joel@tablerockasphalt.com
mailto:rvance@vancebrothes.com
mailto:dpopejoy@journagan.com


$54.65 **Plus haul rate $61.80 **Plus haul rate

$56.88 **Plus haul rate $68.80 **Plus haul rate

$70.81 Per Ton Delivered Buchanan
$71.52 Per Ton Delivered Mt. Branson
$76.03 Per Ton Delivered Hilda

No Bid

Be available the middle of June at Hollister 
South plant

No Bid $2.45No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

$61.00

$56.00 No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$52.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$53.00

$53.00

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid



UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$117.20

$118.45

$104.50

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Young/Kerans Construction
c/o Stacy Young

14475 Lawrence 1220
Marionville, MO. 65705

417-719-8555

youngkeransconstruction@gmail.com

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

mailto:youngkeransconstruction@gmail.com


$63.00

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

$52.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)



UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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