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BID TAB FORM  201109-151
Bid Opening 10-06-2011  @ 9:00a.m.
Self-Propelled Power Broom

BIDDER
Equipment 

Make and Model Price Warranty Total Price Delivery Exception
Potter Equipment "NO BID"
c/o Bill Ellsworth
1155 South Kansas Expressway
Springfield, Mo. 65807
417-862-9275

BIDDER
Equipment 

Make and Model Price Warranty Total Price Delivery Exception
Berry Tractor and Equipment Superior Broom DT80J 41,995.00$     1,660.00$             43,655.00$   6-8 weeks NONE
c/o Tom Suda  3 yr/3000 hrs 
2060 North West Bypass  full machine.  
Springfield, Mo. 65803  no deductible or 
417-831-2651  travel time and 
417-831-5097 (fax)  mileage charge. 

BIDDER
Equipment 

Make and Model Price Warranty Total Price Delivery Exception

Berry Tractor and Equipment Superior Broom SM80J 44,900.00$     1,660.00$             46,560.00$   6-8 weeks
c/o Tom Suda Front Mount Broom  3 yr/3000 hrs 

2060 North West Bypass  full machine.  

Springfield, Mo. 65803  no deductible or 

417-831-2651  travel time and 

417-831-5097 (fax)  mileage charge. 

BIDDER
Equipment 

Make and Model Price Warranty Total Price Delivery Exception
G.W. VanKeppel Co. Broce Broom KR350 40,845.00$     1,153.67$             41,998.67$   30-45 working days
c/o David Bolerjack Front Mount Broom  3 yr/4000 hrs 
6455 W. Independence Dr.
Springfield , Mo. 
417-865-3550
417-865-1044 (fax)

1. Travel speed: 1-12 low range and 0-22 
high range.                                                        
2. Brush speed is varied through engine 
RPM.                                                                  
3. Rear axle suspension is not avalible.                                                                                                                                                                                            

1. Broce will provide a Kubota 84.5 HP tier 3 
diesel engine, the CID is 199.               2. 
Ether start can't be provided on engines that 
meet tier 3 emmissions standard.                                                          
3. Max weight will be approx 7000 lb with an 
operator and the water tank full.                                                                                                
4. Brush RPM on a 350 Broce Broom is 192 
under load.                                                                  
5. Front axle on a 350 Broce Broom is 
hydraulic disc brakes, nor drum brakes. 6. 
Broce will not supply a rear axle suspension 
system.                                    7. We will 
provice our standard operators, parts and 
maintenance manuals. 
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BIDDER
Equipment 

Make and Model Price Warranty Total Price Delivery Exception    

2010 Broce Broom RJ350 Used 35,250.00$     35,250.00$   
G.W. VanKeppel Co. 
c/o David Bolerjack
6455 W. Independence Dr.
Springfield , Mo. 
417-865-3550
417-865-1044 (fax)

Equipment 
Make and Model Price Warranty Total Price Delivery Exception

BIDDER "NO BID" -$              
Murphy Tractor 
c/o Jason Parker
1401 S. State Hwy AA
Springfield , Mo. 
417-7733028

Equipment 
Make and Model Price Warranty Total Price Delivery Exception

BIDDER "NO BID" -$              
A. E. Finley.com

The Taney County Commission voted unanimously today, 10-13-2011, to award the Bid for a Self-Propelled Power Broom to G.W. VanKeppel Co.

No warranty, comes with only the specs 
listed, subject to availability. 
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		BID TAB FORM  201109-151

		Bid Opening 10-06-2011  @ 9:00a.m.

		Self-Propelled Power Broom

		BIDDER		Equipment 
Make and Model		Price		Warranty		Total Price		Delivery		Exception

		Potter Equipment		"NO BID"

		c/o Bill Ellsworth

		1155 South Kansas Expressway

		Springfield, Mo. 65807

		417-862-9275

		BIDDER		Equipment 
Make and Model		Price		Warranty		Total Price		Delivery		Exception

		Berry Tractor and Equipment		Superior Broom DT80J		$   41,995.00		$   1,660.00		$   43,655.00		6-8 weeks		NONE

		c/o Tom Suda						3 yr/3000 hrs

		2060 North West Bypass						full machine.

		Springfield, Mo. 65803						no deductible or

		417-831-2651						travel time and

		417-831-5097 (fax)						mileage charge.

		BIDDER		Equipment 
Make and Model		Price		Warranty		Total Price		Delivery		Exception

		Berry Tractor and Equipment		Superior Broom SM80J		$   44,900.00		$   1,660.00		$   46,560.00		6-8 weeks		1. Travel speed: 1-12 low range and 0-22 high range.                                                        2. Brush speed is varied through engine RPM.                                                                  3. Rear axle suspension is not avalible.

		c/o Tom Suda		Front Mount Broom				3 yr/3000 hrs

		2060 North West Bypass						full machine.

		Springfield, Mo. 65803						no deductible or

		417-831-2651						travel time and

		417-831-5097 (fax)						mileage charge.

		BIDDER		Equipment 
Make and Model		Price		Warranty		Total Price		Delivery		Exception

		G.W. VanKeppel Co.		Broce Broom KR350		$   40,845.00		$   1,153.67		$   41,998.67		30-45 working days		1. Broce will provide a Kubota 84.5 HP tier 3 diesel engine, the CID is 199.               2. Ether start can't be provided on engines that meet tier 3 emmissions standard.                                                          3. Max weight will be approx 7000 lb with an operator and the water tank full.                                                                                                4. Brush RPM on a 350 Broce Broom is 192 under load.                                                                  5. Front axle on a 350 Broce Broom is hydraulic disc brakes, nor drum brakes. 6. Broce will not supply a rear axle suspension system.                                    7. We will provice our standard operators, parts and maintenance manuals.

		c/o David Bolerjack		Front Mount Broom				3 yr/4000 hrs

		6455 W. Independence Dr.

		Springfield , Mo.

		417-865-3550

		417-865-1044 (fax)

		BIDDER		Equipment 
Make and Model		Price		Warranty		Total Price		Delivery		Exception

				2010 Broce Broom RJ350 Used		$   35,250.00				$   35,250.00				No warranty, comes with only the specs listed, subject to availability.

		G.W. VanKeppel Co.

		c/o David Bolerjack

		6455 W. Independence Dr.

		Springfield , Mo.

		417-865-3550

		417-865-1044 (fax)

				Equipment 
Make and Model		Price		Warranty		Total Price		Delivery		Exception

		BIDDER		"NO BID"						$   - 0

		Murphy Tractor

		c/o Jason Parker

		1401 S. State Hwy AA

		Springfield , Mo.

		417-7733028

				Equipment 
Make and Model		Price		Warranty		Total Price		Delivery		Exception

		BIDDER		"NO BID"						$   - 0

		A. E. Finley.com

		The Taney County Commission voted unanimously today, 10-13-2011, to award the Bid for a Self-Propelled Power Broom to G.W. VanKeppel Co.
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