TANEY COUNTY COMMISSION

BID AWARD
BID DATE: April 5, 2023
BID FOR: Aggregate Rock
BID NUMBER: 202303-523
No. TRAC QL(J¢(’)\In-I;I)TY LoaBthEdP; g:cEa.Ied LoaBthEdP; g:cEa.Ied L(gg:trig/n
(Est. for By SUPPLIER — By COUNTY —
2023) Category 1 Category 2
A | %4 Clean Chips * 1,500 $14.45 No Bid KimBgzﬂ;‘;”’City
B 3/8” Clean Chips ** 15,000 $14.45 “ “
C %" Clean (Concrete Rock) 1,000 $10.95 “ “
D 1” Base Material 25,000 $5.25 “ “
E 2” Base Material 3,000 $5.45
F 0-6" Sub-Base Material 15,000 $6.45 $5.85 “
G | 2-6” Sub-Base Material 5,000 $7.45 No Bid
H 4" Grit (Ice Control Material) 1,000 $14.95 “
I Rip-Rap — Type 2 (6" — 127) 5.000 $19.45 $18.85 “
J Shot Rock — Type 4 (18" — 24”) 5,000 $19.45 $18.85
QUANTITY BID PRICE: BID PRICE: Quar'ry
Voo | CAPITALMATERIALS | (o9 | lostedisoes | Losaedsfouea | Locason
2023) Category 1 Category 2
A $17.00 No Bid Hollister South ||
2" Clean Chips * 1,500 Hilda
B $17.00 No Bid Hollister South ||
3/8” Clean Chips ** 15,000 Hilda
c $14.00 No Bid Hollister South ||
%" Clean (Concrete Rock) 1,000 Hilda
b $7.25 $6.75 Hollister South ||
1” Base Material 25,000 Hilda
E $7.00 $6.50 Hollister South ||
2” Base Material 3,000 Hilda
. $7.00 $6.50 Hollister South ||
0-6” Sub-Base Material 15,000 Hilda
G $11.00 $10.50 Hollister South ||
2-6” Sub-Base Material 5,000 Hilda
H $16.00 No Bid Hollister South ||
4" Grit (Ice Control Material) 1,000 Hilda
| No Bid No Bid Hollister South ||
Rip-Rap — Type 2 (6" — 12”) 5,000 Hilda
3 $8.00 $7.50 Hollister South ||
Shot Rock — Type 4 (18" — 24”) 5,000 Hilda
QUANTITY BID PRICE WHEN; BID PRICE WHEN; Quar_ry
No. Green Dream International o | e | o coinmes Location
2023) Category 1 Category 2
%" Clean Chips * 1,500 $12.84 $12.84 Ava
B 3/8” Clean Chips ** 15,000 No Bid No Bid
%" Clean (Concrete Rock) 1,000 $10.70 $10.70 Ava




D 1” Base Material 25,000 $6.96 $6.96 Branson
E 2” Base Material 3,000 $6.96 $6.96 Branson
F 0-6" Sub-Base Material 15,000 $6.69 $6.69 Branson
G 2-6" Sub-Base Material 5,000 $9.10 $9.10 Branson
H V4" Grit (Ice Control Material) 1,000 No Bid No Bid

| Rip-Rap — Type 2 (6" — 12”) 5,000 $19.26 $19.26 Branson
J Shot Rock — Type 4 (18” — 24”) 5,000 $5.08 $5.08 Branson

(**NOTE: Pricing is the same whether by Supplier or County)

Wednesday, April 5, 2023: After opening responses from all three (3) of the above listed companies,
initial details were noted and documented by Road & Bridge Administrator, Devin Huff. Also present
was Jack Cole, Road & Bridge Supervisor and Nick Plummer, Presiding Commissioner and myself.
Response packages will be thoroughly reviewed by Road & Bridge staff. An agenda request has been
made, and approved, to deliver a formal recommendation for award to the Taney County Commission
on Monday, April 10, 2023.

Monday, April 10, 2023: After a thorough review and in making the best choices for the County Mr.
Huff has the following recommendations:

For Category 1 (Loaded & Scaled by Supplier) awarding Table Rock Asphalt Construction Co. as
Supplier A for all locations, Capital Materials as Supplier B for the Hollister South location, and Green
Dream as Supplier C.

For Category 2 (Loaded & Scaled by County) awarding Table Rock Asphalt Construction Co. as
Supplier A for the Nickens location, Capital Materials as Supplier A for the Hilda location.

We hereby ask for a motion vote to award per the recommendations as outlined above.
The Taney County Commission made a motion and awarded as such.

Thanks.

Nikki Lawrence,
Director of Purchasing,
Taney County, Missouri
April 10, 2023




