FINAL BID AWARD TABULATION

BID NUMBER: 201903-427 FOR: AGGREGATE ROCK BID DATE: April 24, 2019

— PRODUCT QUANTITY CATEGORY 1 BID RESPONS_ES CATEGORY 2 BID RESPONSES
(Esthfgpg)m) (Loaded & Scaled = by Supplier) (Loaded & Scaled = by County)

Responding Vendors = | Journagan | TRAC |Buchanan | APAC Journagan | TRAC |Buchanan | APAC

Quarry Location = HOLLISTER BRANSON BRANSON BRANSON HILDA N/A N/A N/A
3.1 | %" Clean Chips 1500 $10.00 $9.50 NO-BID $10.00 $18.07 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID
3.2 | 3/8" Clean Chips 15,000 $13.00 $9.50 NO-BID | $10.25 $21.07 NO-BID | NO-BID NO-BID
3.3 | %" Clean (Concrete Rock) 1000 $10.00 $9.50 $8.50 $9.50 $12.50 NO-BID | NO-BID NO-BID
3.4 | 1” Base Material 15,000 $5.45 $4.60 $5.25 $5.50 $7.50 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID
3.5 | 2" Base Material 3,000 $5.25 $4.60 $5.50 $5.50 $7.50 NO-BID | NO-BID NO-BID
3.6 | 0-6” Sub-Base Material 10,000 $6.25 $4.60 $5.25 $5.00 $7.50 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID
3.7 | 2-6” Sub-Base Material 5000 $6.25 $5.70 NO-BID $6.50 $7.50 NO-BID | NO-BID NO-BID
3.8 | Pugged Base Rock 0 NO-BID $5.50 NO-BID | NO-BID N/A NO-BID | NO-BID NO-BID
3.9 | ¥ Grit (Ice Control Material) 1000 $10.00 $10.00 NO-BID $8.00 $10.00 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID
3.10 | Rip-Rap 2500 $15.00 $14.00 $13.50 $14.00 $17.00 NO-BID | NO-BID NO-BID
3.11 | Shot Rock (up to 12" size rock) 2500 $5.00 $4.00 $5.25 $5.50 $7.00 NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID

Wednesday April 24, 2019: After opening responses from all four (4) of the above listed companies
today, total cost response details were noted and documented by Road & Bridge Highway
Administrator Devin Huff, Assistant Highway Administrator Denzel Brown, and me. All of the complete
response packages will be thoroughly reviewed by Taney County Road & Bridge Staff. Shortly
afterward an agenda request was made, and approved, to deliver a formal recommendation for award
to the Taney County Commission on Monday April 29, 2019.

Monday April 29, 2019: After a thorough review Mr. Huff made the following recommendations based
on bid instruction #1.25, checked off and initialed at the page bottom (P.5) by all four (4) Vendors.

For Category 1 above, which is for “Loaded & Scaled = by Supplier”, in an effort to make the best
choices for the County, per bid instruction #1.25, Mr. Huff recommend awarding to Table Rock Asphalt
Company as “A” Supplier. APAC as “B” Supplier, Journagan as “C” Supplier, and Buchanan as “D”
Supplier - for the County Aggregate Rock needs within that category accordingly to follow the above
bid pricing by each.

For Category 2 above, which is for “Loaded & Scaled = by County”, Mr. Huff recommend the only
Vendor who offered pricing responses for Category 2 — Journagan.

The Taney County Commission then made a motion vote to award as recommended which passed
unanimously. A subsequent agreement will be issued for an initial period of 12 months with three (3)
one (1) year renewal options contingent upon pricing at that time.

Thank you.
Ron Erickson,
Director of Purchasing
Taney County Missouri
April 29, 2019




