
 

BID TABULATION FORM 

BID DATE;   Thursday May 2, 2013 

BID FOR;   Aggregate Road Materials 

BID NUMBER;    RFB# 201304-220 

 
 

Thursday May 2, 2013: The Taney County Commission met in reference to the above listed RFB. After opening 
responses from ten (10) different Vendors, a request was made to set a time certain for a recommendation after 
review.  Monday May 13, 2013 was set for said recommendation. 

Monday May 13, 2013: Subsequent to a thorough review by Randy Haes with Road & Bridge, of all the detailed pricing 
offered, – in great detail – Mr. Haes recommended awarding per the attached letter from him to the Taney County 
Commission – in the order, as detailed, per his list. (NOTE: Concerning Groups #4 thru #5.3 the award 
recommendations were not to the Low Bidder as listed on paper which was due to factoring in mileage, haul, and pick 
up costs.)The Taney County Commission made a motion on each “Group Item Number” separately, and voted on each 
passing all unanimously. Please see attached letter as well as full Bid Tab. (Prepared by: Kathy Roberts, Taney County 
Road & Bridge Office Manager.) 

 
Thank you. 

 

Ron Erickson, 
Director of Purchasing 

Taney County Missouri 
May 13, 2013 



BID TAB FORM  201304-220
Aggregate Road Materials

  
1.0 AGGREGATE ROCK:

Unit
HOLLISTER NORTH HOLLISTER NORTH HOLLISTER NORTH

DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP DELIVERED PICKED UP

1.1 1/2" Clean Chips 5,000 Ton No Bid No Bid $9.25 $8.25 $13.75 $8.25 $10.00 $8.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.20 $14.00 No Bid $14.00 No Bid $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.85 9.95 17.35 9.95 12.15 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.2 3/8" Clean Chips 25,000 Ton No Bid No Bid $9.00 $7.50 $13.00 $7.50 $9.10 $7.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.20 $14.00 No Bid $14.00 No Bid $14.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.85 9.95 17.35 9.95 12.15 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.3 3/4" Clean Chips  (Concrete Rock) 500 Ton No Bid No Bid $8.25 $7.25 $12.75 $7.25 $9.00 $7.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.20 $12.00 No Bid $12.00 No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.85 9.95 17.35 9.95 12.15 9.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.4 1" Base Material 25,000 Ton No Bid No Bid $5.00 $4.00 $9.50 $4.00 $6.10 $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.70 $5.50 $7.80 $5.50 No Bid $5.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.40 4.50 11.90 4.50 6.70 4.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.5 2" Base Material 1,000 Ton No Bid No Bid $5.30 $4.30 $9.80 $4.30 $6.40 $4.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.70 $5.50 $8.10 $5.50 No Bid $5.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.65 4.75 12.15 4.75 6.95 4.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.6 0-6" Sub-Base Material 25,000 Ton No Bid No Bid $5.30 $4.30 $9.80 $4.30 $6.40 $4.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.85 $5.65 $8.35 $5.65 No Bid $5.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.90 5.00 12.40 5.00 7.20 5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.7 2-6" Sub-Base Material 1,000 Ton No Bid No Bid $6.25 $5.25 $10.75 $5.25 $7.25 $5.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.80 $6.60 $8.60 $6.60 No Bid $6.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.90 6.00 13.40 6.00 8.20 6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.8 Pugged Base Rock 2,000 Ton No Bid No Bid $6.00 $5.00 $10.50 $5.00 $7.40 $5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.90 5.00 12.40 5.00 7.20 5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$5.90-1/4" Grit $3.00- 1/4" Grit $10.9-1/4" Grit $3.00- 1/4" Grit $5.20-1/4" Grit $3.00- 1/4" Grit

1.9 1/4" Grit (Ice Control Material) 5,000 Ton No Bid No Bid $5.00 $4.00 $9.50 $4.00 $6.10 $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.70 $9.50 No Bid $9.50 No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.90 -1/4" Ice Control $6.00- 1/4" Ice Control $13.4 -1/4" Ice Control $6.00- 1/4" Ice Control $8.20 -1/4" Ice Control $6.00- 1/4" Ice Control No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.10 Rip Rap 5,000 Ton No Bid No Bid $10.25 $9.25 $14.75 $9.25 $12.50 $9.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.53 $16.00 $18.20 $16.00 No Bid $16.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.10 13.00 20.60 13.00 15.40 13.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.11 Shot Rock (up to 12" size rock) 10,000 Ton No Bid No Bid $5.00 $4.00 $9.50 $4.00 $6.50 $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.03 $5.50 $7.20 $5.50 No Bid $5.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.10 5.00 12.60 5.00 7.40 5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.0

Unit

2.1 MC 30 500 Gallon

2.2 MC 800 5,000 Gallon

2.3 MC 3000 200,000 Gallon

3.0

Unit

3.1 EA-300 10,000 Gallon

3.2 SS-1 20,000 Gallon

3.3 CRS-2P 50,000 Gallon

3.4 CRS-2 50,000 Gallon

3.5 CQS-1FS (Rapid Set Fogseal) 25,000 Gallon

4.0

Unit

4.1 Black Base, Hot Mix 10,000 Ton $55.25 **Plus haul rate $44.05 **Plus haul rate $48.97 **Plus haul rate $48.97 **Plus haul rate $48.97 **Plus haul rate $61.80 **Plus haul rate $61.80 **Plus haul rate $61.80 **Plus haul rate

4.2 Hot Mix Surface Material 15,000 Ton $57.70 **Plus haul rate $48.25 **Plus haul rate $53.57 **Plus haul rate $53.57 **Plus haul rate $53.57 **Plus haul rate $68.80 **Plus haul rate $68.80 **Plus haul rate $68.80 **Plus haul rate

5.0

Unit

5.1 Black Base, Hot Mix 1,000 Ton

5.2 Hot Mix Surface Material 15,000 Ton

5.3 Cold Mix Patch 2,500 Ton

6.0

Unit

$56.90 Buchanan
$58.30 Mt. Branson $49.88 Per Ton Delivered Buchanan $54.63 Per Ton Delivered Buchanan

6.1 Cold Mix Patch 3,500 Ton $62.77 **Plus haul rate $59.40 Hilda $54.75 Per Ton Delivered Mt. Branson $59.50 Per Ton Delivered Mt. Branson
$54.75 Per Ton Delivered Hilda $59.50 Per Ton Delivered Hilda

7.0

Unit

7.1 Concrete Class B 300 Cubic Yards

7.2 Standard 6-Bag Mix 300 Cubic Yards

7.3 Flowable Fill 300 Cubic Yards

8.0

Unit

$5.00 Undercut Dirt $6.00 Undercut Dirt
8.1 Finish Dirt 2,000 Yard $12.00 Screened $12.00 Screened $12.00 Screened $7.00 Top Soil with Sod $8.00 Top Soil with Sod

$3.50 Un-Screened $3.50 Un-Screened $3.50 Un-Screened $12.00 Screened $13.00 Screened

Red Primary

Blue Secondary

Green Third

Stallcup & Sons
c/o John Stallcup

P.O. Box 783
Forsyth, MO. 65653

417-546-0866

jandbstallcup@centrylink.net

Tablerock Asphalt Construction
c/o Jim David
P.O. Box 1165

Branson, MO. 65615
417-334-2144

Fax-417-334-2157
david@tracmaterials.com

Young/Kerans Construction
c/o Stacy Young

14475 Lawrence 1220
Marionville, MO. 65705

417-719-8555

youngkeransconstruction@gmail.com

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.59

$3.10

$2.86

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

EMULSIFIED ASPHALT MATERIALS FURNISHED AND DELIVERED TO VARIOUS 
LOCATION IN TANEY COUNTY:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Item Number Quantity 
(Estimate for 

2014)

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

BITMINOUS MIX BIDS, FURNISHED AND LAID IN PLACE AT VARIOUS 
LOCATIONS IN TANEY COUNTY, AS PER PREVALING WAGE:

Item Number Quantity 
(Estimate for 

2014)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2.39No Bid

No Bid $1.94

No Bid No Bid

Quantity 
(Estimate for 

2014)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

$2.12

Quantity 
(Estimate for 

2014)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$2.38

$2.08

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

Item Number 

ASPHALT MATERIALS,FURNISHED AND DELIVERED TO VAIOUS LOCATIONS IN 
TANEY COUNTY:

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

Item Number UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

BITMINOUS MIX BIDS, FURNISHED AND LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT 
BIDDERS PLANT:

Item Number Quantity 
(Estimate for 

2014)

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

$51.00 $50.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$53.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid $52.00

$55.00No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

$52.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$54.00

$55.00

No Bid

$62.00

$54.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

$48.25

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

BITMINOUS MIX BIDS, DELIVERED TO ALL COUNTY FACILITIES:

No Bid No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

Item Number Quantity 
(Estimate for 

2014)

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$57.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

CONCRETE FURNISHED AND DELIVERED TO VARIOUS LOCATIONS IN TANEY 
COUNTY:

Item Number Quantity 
(Estimate for 

2014)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

FINISHED DIRT LOADED ON COUNTY TRUCKS AT PIT OT QUARRY"

Item Number Quantity 
(Estimate for 

2014)

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$86.00

$87.00

$64.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$103.00

$97.50

$83.50

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$102.00

$100.00

$90.80

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

jholiman@concocompanies.com dpopejoy@journagan.com

No Bid

Leo Journagan Construction Co., Inc.
c/o Dale Popejoy

3003 E. Chestnut Expwy, Suite 1200
Springfield, MO. 65802

417-869-7222
Fax-417-869-7421

Concrete Company of the Ozarks
c/o John Holiman

P.O. Box 1565
Branson, Mo. 65616

417-863-2000
Fax-417-863-2065

scrabtree@blevinsasphalt.com

417-743-2694
Fax-417-743-2945

mdonelson@cleverstone.com

417-466-3758
Fax-417-466-7914

Clever Stone Co., Inc.
c/o Michael J. Donelson

1075 Wise Hill Road
Clever, MO. 65631

Blevins Asphalt Const. Co. Inc.
c/o Teresa G. Stokes

P.O. Box 230
Mt. Vernon, MO. 65712

Coastal Energy Corp.
c/o Chad Odle
P.O. Box 218

Willow Springs, MO. 
417-469-2777

Fax-417-469-4492
chad@coastal-fmc.comdavid.foreman@apac.com

American Rock & Concrete
c/o Mike Swearengin
1150 Buchanan Road
Branson, MO. 65616

417-337-7625
Fax-417-224-1693

mtsman2002@yahoo.com

APAC-Missouri, Inc. 
c/o David B.Anderson

4580 W. Calhoun/P.O. Box 1187
Springfield, MO. 65802

417-868-6700
Fax-417-868-6785

American Rock & Concrete
c/o Mike Swearengin
1150 Buchanan Road
Branson, MO. 65616

417-337-7625
Fax-417-224-1693

$87.00

$64.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID) UNIT PRICE (BID)

American Rock & Concrete
c/o Mike Swearengin
1150 Buchanan Road
Branson, MO. 65616

417-337-7625
Fax-417-224-1693

mtsman2002@yahoo.com dpopejoy@journagan.com

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$86.00

$87.00

$64.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

mtsman2002@yahoo.com

$86.00

Leo Journagan Construction Co., Inc.
c/o Dale Popejoy

3003 E. Chestnut Expwy, Suite 1200
Springfield, MO. 65802

417-869-7222
Fax-417-869-7421

UNIT PRICE (BID)UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid No Bid

DELIVERED BUCHANAN DELIVERED HILDA DELIVERED MT. BRANSON

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No BidNo Bid

417-546-0866

jandbstallcup@centrylink.net

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Stallcup & Sons
c/o John Stallcup

P.O. Box 783
Forsyth, MO. 65653

No Bid

Leo Journagan Construction Co., Inc.
c/o Dale Popejoy

3003 E. Chestnut Expwy, Suite 1200
Springfield, MO. 65802

417-869-7222

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

Fax-417-869-7421
dpopejoy@journagan.com

UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$53.00

COUNTY LOADED

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$55.00

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$54.00

$55.00

No Bid

DELIVERED BUCHANANDELIVERED HILDADELIVERED MT. BRANSON

Reed Springs Reed Springs Reed Springs

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$54.00

STALLCUP LOADED

UNIT PRICE (BID)

DELIVERED MT. BRANSON

$63.50-3.8" Hot Mix

DELIVERED MT. BRANSON

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$63.50-3.8" Hot Mix

DELIVERED BUCHANAN

Tablerock Asphalt Construction
c/o Jim David
P.O. Box 1165

Branson, MO. 65615
417-334-2144

Fax-417-334-2157
david@tracmaterials.com

DELIVERED BUCHANAN

UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$53.00

$62.00

$54.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$56.30

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$102.00

$100.00

$90.80

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

Tablerock Asphalt Construction
c/o Jim David
P.O. Box 1165

Branson, MO. 65615
417-334-2144

Fax-417-334-2157
david@tracmaterials.com

DELIVERED HILDA

UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$53.00

$62.00

$54.00
$63.50-3.8" Hot Mix

DELIVERED HILDA

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$61.50

UNIT PRICE (BID)

$102.00

$100.00

$90.80

UNIT PRICE (BID)

Young/Kerans Construction
c/o Stacy Young

14475 Lawrence 1220
Marionville, MO. 65705

417-719-8555

youngkeransconstruction@gmail.com

UNIT PRICE (BID)

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

UNIT PRICE (BID)

No Bid

Cold MIX EMULSION Cold MIX MC-250

No Bid

$53.00

UNIT PRICE (BID)




